
ARE YOU A MEDIA PROFESSIONAL? 
 

MEDIA REQUESTS: Interested media who wish to interview Garden State Film Festival Executives, 
film talent, obtain screening reviews or industry entry please contact LAUREN via 

email lauren@gsff.org or telephone 848.863.9881 
 

The Garden State Film Festival Press Releases & Published Press 
can be downloaded from the links below. 

 
 

2021 MEDIA 
 

PRESS | G.S. FILMFEST SERVES UP SOME HOTHOUSE TOMATOES, VIA LIVE STREAM 
https://upperwetside.wordpress.com/tag/garden-state-film-festival/ 

PRESS | Monmouth County, NJ Town Gets National Praise As One of the ‘Most Charming in America’ 
https://wobm.com/monmouth-county-nj-town-gets-national-praise-as-one-of-the-most-charming-in-americas/ 

PRESS | Hyderabad Techie's Short Film Manase Namaha in Oscar Race! 
https://english.sakshi.com/news/entertainment/hyderabad-techies-short-film-manase-namaha-oscar-race-143608 

PRESS | Hyderabad youth’s short film gets Oscar entry 
https://www.deccanchronicle.com/entertainment/tollywood/230921/city-youths-short-film-gets-oscar-entry.html 

PRESS | Drama ‘Downeast’ Coming to VOD and Digital From Gravitas Ventures 
https://www.mediaplaynews.com/drama-downeast-coming-to-vod-and-digital-from-gravitas-ventures/ 

PRESS | Gritty Festival Hit ‘Downeast’ Starring Greg Finley Debuts on VOD this July! 
https://www.pophorror.com/gritty-festival-hit-downeast-starring-greg-finley-debuts-on-vod-this-july/ 

PRESS | Getting married? Shore musician will sing her new song — and gift you $500 
https://www.app.com/story/entertainment/2021/06/25/eatontown-nj-singer-taurie-weddings/7698654002/ 

PRESS | FUTURE LEADER: Prince George's student pursues filmmaking while uplifting her community 
https://wjla.com/sponsored/future-leaders/md-student-pursues-filmmaking-while-uplifting-community 

PRESS | Multi-Instrumentalist and Award-Winner Singer Taurie Released a Brand New Track ‘Happily Falling’ 
https://yourdigitalwall.com/2021/06/15/multi-instrumentalist-and-award-winner-singer-taurie-released-a-brand-new-track-happily-falling/ 

PRESS | American Pakistani Zuher Khan set to release ‘The Hollywood Experience’ 
https://nation.com.pk/09-Jun-2021/american-pakistani-zuher-khan-set-to-release-the-hollywood-experience 

PRESS | MCVTS Film Fest Streams on YouTube as Students Earn Multiple Honors 
https://www.tapinto.net/sections/education/articles/mcvts-film-fest-streams-on-youtube-as-students-earn-multiple-honors 

PRESS | Summer Is About Break Out Songs, Taurie Agrees With Her Latest Single “Hypnotize Me" 
https://www.digitaljournal.com/pr/summer-is-about-break-out-songs-taurie-agrees-with-her-latest-single-hypnotize-me 

PRESS | N-Pop Artist, Taurie, Drops New Single, Hypnotize Me 
https://www.digitaljournal.com/pr/n-pop-artist-taurie-drops-new-single-hypnotize-me 
PRESS | Celebs That Love To Shop For Sales At Forever 21 
https://www.digitaljournal.com/pr/celebs-that-love-to-shop-for-sales-at-forever-21 

PRESS | Granger on Film: Westport native crafts suspenseful film 
https://www.westport-news.com/news/article/Granger-on-Film-Westport-native-crafts-16183414.php 

PRESS | Trailer: GOODBYE HONEY Now Set to Hold You Captive on May 11th 
https://www.dreadcentral.com/news/395420/trailer-goodbye-honey-now-set-to-hold-you-captive-on-may-11th/ 



PRESS | Check Out the Trailer For the Abduction Thriller GOODBYE HONEY – On VOD May 11th 
http://www.wearemoviegeeks.com/2021/04/check-out-the-trailer-for-the-abduction-thriller-goodbye-honey-on-vod-may-11th/ 

PRESS | Taurie Has Advice For You – Ignore Them And Go For It 
https://jumbonews.co.uk/uncategorised/3440279/taurie-has-advice-for-you-ignore-them-and-go-for-it-2/ 

PRESS | ‘The Stamp Collector’ Short Film Receives Festival Recognition 
https://fordhamobserver.com/62819/arts-and-culture/the-stamp-collector-short-film-receives-festival-recognition/ 

PRESS | HIP Video Promo presents: TAURIE radiates kinetic energy in new music video "HYPNOTIZE ME" 
https://www.einnews.com/pr_news/538833797/hip-video-promo-presents-taurie-radiates-kinetic-energy-in-new-music-video-hypnotize-
me 

PRESS | Calhoun H.S. Student and Mom Appear In Documentary 
https://patch.com/new-york/bellmore/calhoun-h-s-student-mom-appear-documentary 

PRESS | Abduction Thriller ‘Goodbye Honey’ Follows a Night of Terror on VOD this May 
https://www.pophorror.com/abduction-thriller-goodbye-honey-follows-a-night-of-terror-on-vod-this-may/ 

PRESS | TAPinto TV Wins Twice at Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.tapinto.net/towns/bernardsville-and-bedminster/columns/tapinto-insider/articles/tapinto-tv-wins-twice-at-garden-state-film-
festival 

  
PRESS | “My Promise to PJ” a film featuring all 4 Baldwin Brothers, a story about Courage, Determination, Strength 
https://themagazineplus.com/2021/04/13/my-promise-to-pj-a-film-featuring-all-4-baldwin-brothers-a-story-about-courage-determination-
strength/ 

  
PRESS | Merrick Mother And Daughter Create Award-Winning Documentary 
https://patch.com/new-york/merrick/calhoun-student-mother-create-award-winning-documentary 

PRESS | NJ Actress and Co-Producer Premieres Thriller Set in 70s New York at the 2021 Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.tapinto.net/sections/tapintotv/articles/nj-actress-and-co-producer-premieres-thriller-set-in-70s-new-york-at-the-2021-
garden-state-film-festival 

PRESS | Daniel Baldwin wins award for film featuring all 4 acting brothers; Alec says he’s ‘very proud’ 
https://www.syracuse.com/entertainment/2021/04/daniel-baldwin-wins-award-for-film-featuring-all-4-acting-brothers-alec-says-hes-very-
proud.html 

PRESS | Booming New Jersey Film Industry Showcased at 19th Annual Garden State Film Festival in Asbury Park 
https://www.tapinto.net/sections/tapintotv/articles/booming-new-jersey-film-industry-showcased-at-19th-annual-garden-state-film-
festival-in-asbury-park 

PRESS | N.J. filmmaker explores the ‘dark elements of human nature’ in newest feature film 
https://www.jerseysbest.com/community/n-j-filmmaker-explores-the-dark-elements-of-human-nature-in-newest-feature-film/ 

PRESS | Students and faculty earn 2021 Broadcast Education Awards 
https://today.rowan.edu/news/2021/03/rowan-students-and-faculty-earn-2021-broadcast-education-awards.html 

PRESS | Daniel Baldwin on Directing Documentary "My Promise To PJ" at 2021 Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.tapinto.net/sections/tapintotv/articles/daniel-baldwin-on-directing-documentary-my-promise-to-pj-at-2021-garden-state-film-
festival 

PRESS | “My Promise to PJ” a film featuring all 4 Baldwin Brothers, a story about Courage, Determination, Strength 
https://themagazineplus.com/2021/04/13/my-promise-to-pj-a-film-featuring-all-4-baldwin-brothers-a-story-about-courage-determination-
strength/ 

PRESS | GARDEN STATE FILM FESTIVAL Victory + Award Winners 
https://www.filmfestivals.com/blog/awardswatch/garden_state_film_festival_victory_award_winners 

PRESS | Merrick Mother And Daughter Create Award-Winning Documentary 
https://patch.com/new-york/merrick/calhoun-student-mother-create-award-winning-documentary 



PRESS | Baldwin Wins Award for Film with 3 Siblings 
https://www.gsff.org/wp-content/uploads/Newsday-Baldwin-GSFF.pdf 

PRESS | Director Joe Raffa discusses storytelling roots and upcoming premiere of new film ‘Downeast’ 
https://www.amny.com/news/director-joe-raffa-discusses-storytelling-roots-and-new-film-downeast/ 

PRESS | BETTE DAVIS AIN'T FOR SISSIES to be Available for Streaming on Demand 
https://www.broadwayworld.com/off-broadway/article/BETTE-DAVIS-AINT-FOR-SISSIES-to-be-Available-for-Streaming-on-Demand-
20210326 

PRESS | "One All The Way" - Film About "Hot Texas Weiner" and Paterson NJ To Premiere at Garden State Film Festival On 
March 28 
https://www.newjerseystage.com/articles/2021/03/25/one-all-the-way-film-about-hot-texas-weiner-and-paterson-nj-to-premiere-at-
garden-state-film-festival-on-march-28/ 

PRESS | Deepak Reddy's ''Manasanamaha'' to be screened at the prestigious Garden State Film Festival in New Jersey 
https://timesofindia.indiatimes.com/entertainment/telugu/movies/news/deepak-reddys-manasanamaha-to-be-screened-at-the-
prestigious-garden-state-film-festival-in-new-jersey/articleshow/81711246.cms 

PRESS | Garden State Film Festival to take place in Asbury Park with some in-person events 
https://newjersey.news12.com/garden-state-film-festival-to-take-place-in-asbury-park-with-some-in-person-events 

PRESS | ONE ALL THE WAY Short Documentary Premieres at Garden State Film Festival March 28th; Critically Acclaimed 
Film Explores Hot Texas Weiner's Historic Impact on Paterson NJ 
https://www.wfmz.com/news/pr_newswire/pr_newswire_food_beverages/one-all-the-way-short-documentary-premieres-at-garden-
state-film-festival-march-28th-critically/article_dc8aabd5-2f2b-52f1-adf2-e37812a208e5.html 

PRESS | Things to do for all of you 
https://atlanticcityweekly.com/arts_and_entertainment/things-to-do-for-all-of-you/article_8f0409ee-b240-50eb-9df4-c2c951f330bc.html 

PRESS | Coronavirus in N.J.: What’s reopened, what concerts, festivals and shows are rescheduled, canceled. 
https://www.nj.com/entertainment/2021/03/coronavirus-in-nj-whats-reopened-what-concerts-festivals-and-shows-are-rescheduled-
canceled-march-24-2021.html 

PRESS | Film Short by Fairfield Resident to be Screened at Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.tapinto.net/towns/west-essex/sections/arts-and-entertainment/articles/film-short-by-fairfield-resident-to-be-screened-at-
garden-state-film-festival?fbclid=IwAR1JMLbQILid7k2_nmx11-h_rdNVTYxXsjyTewlgE_WpmNkyaaXxYGTreoU 

PRESS | In-person and virtual screenings on the Garden State Film Fest marquee 
https://www.nj.com/entertainment/2021/03/in-person-and-virtual-screenings-on-the-garden-state-film-fest-marquee.html 

PRESS | Garden State Film Festival Coming To Asbury Park 
https://patch.com/new-jersey/asbury-park/garden-state-film-festival-coming-asbury-park 

PRESS | Documentary on Msgr. Doyle will be livestreamed through film festival 
https://catholicstarherald.org/documentary-on-msgr-doyle-will-be-livestreamed-through-film-festival/ 

PRESS | Garden State Film Festival back with streaming movies, live screenings in Asbury Park 
https://www.northjersey.com/story/entertainment/movies/2021/03/18/garden-state-film-festival-2021-asbury-park-and-
online/6836141002/ 

PRESS | Fair Haven resident’s work to be shown at Garden State Film Festival 
https://centraljersey.com/2021/03/17/chris-brenner/ 

PRESS | Area residents will appear in work to be screened at Garden State Film Festival 
https://centraljersey.com/2021/03/17/justin-guerrieri-and-ryan-moore/ 

PRESS | Garden State Film Festival back with streaming movies, live screenings in Asbury Park 
https://www.app.com/story/entertainment/movies/2021/03/18/garden-state-film-festival-2021-asbury-park-and-online/6836141002/ 

PRESS | Howell filmmaker will have work, ‘Still With Us,’ shown at festival 
https://centraljersey.com/2021/03/17/jared-garcia/ 



PRESS | The Windermere actor revels in the chance to be someone new with each film or stage character 
https://www.orangeobserver.com/photo-gallery/david-raizor-adapts-to-fit-screen-roles 

PRESS | Colts Neck Movie Director Jordan Goldstein, selected for Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.tapinto.net/towns/middletown/sections/arts-and-entertainment/articles/colts-neck-movie-director-jordan-goldstein-selected-
for-garden-state-film-festival 

PRESS | Director Reflects On Gloucester Twp. Roots Ahead Of Film Premiere 
https://patch.com/new-jersey/gloucestertownship/director-reflects-gloucester-twp-roots-ahead-film-premiere 

PRESS | Monmouth County News Briefs, March 10 
https://centraljersey.com/2021/03/09/monmouth-county-news-briefs-march-10/ 

PRESS | Maplewood, Orange filmmakers selected for Garden State Film Festival 
https://essexnewsdaily.com/arts/95654 

PRESS | IT’S SHOWTIME – THE GARDEN STATE FILM FESTIVAL RETURNS 
https://www.movie-blogger.com/its-showtime-the-garden-state-film-festival-returns/ 

PRESS | Pakistani-American’s Film On Affinity With A Homeless Aims Straight For The Heart 
http://www.viewsnews.net/2021/02/12/pakistani-americans-film-affinity-homeless-aims-straight-heart/ 

PRESS | Pakistani-American director delivers powerful short film, Tikkun Olam 
https://dailytimes.com.pk/716976/pakistani-american-director-delivers-powerful-short-film-tikkun-olam/ 

PRESS | Local director's debut feature film chosen for DIFF 
https://www.westmeathexaminer.ie/2021/02/23/local-directors-debut-feature-film-chosen-for-diff/ 

PRESS |SHORT FILM REVIEWS 
https://take2indiereview.net/2021/02/victim-no-6/ 

PODCAST | Garden State Film Festival LIVE with with Chance Kelly 
https://youtu.be/gy57fsZgDuc 

PODCAST | Garden State Film Festival LIVE with Pete Normandia | Reclaimed Relics 
https://youtu.be/gy57fsZgDuc 

PRESS | Pakistani-American’s Film On Affinity With A Homeless Aims Straight For The Heart 
http://www.viewsnews.net/2021/02/12/pakistani-americans-film-affinity-homeless-aims-straight-heart/ 

PRESS | GSFF Adds A Sixth Day And Welcoming Their Newest Screening Location, The Cranford Theater 
https://www.movie-blogger.com/gsff-adds-a-sixth-day-and-welcoming-their-newest-screening-location-the-cranford-theater/ 

PRESS | "Be careful who you leave with" written and directed by Nancy Menagh enters the circuit this month 
https://www.filmfestivals.com/blog/editor/be_careful_who_you_leave_with_written_and_directed_by_nancy_menagh_enters_the_circuit
_this_month 

PRESS | Filmmakers Menagh & O’Scanlon Premiere Trailer For Short Thriller Victim No. 6 
https://www.movie-blogger.com/filmmakers-menagh-oscanlon-premiere-trailer-for-short-thriller-victim-no-6/ 

PRESS | Pakistani-American director delivers powerful short film, Tikkun Olam 
https://dailytimes.com.pk/716976/pakistani-american-director-delivers-powerful-short-film-tikkun-olam/ 

PRESS | The Cranford Theater Joins the Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.broadwayworld.com/new-jersey/article/The-Cranford-Theater-Joins-the-Garden-State-Film-Festival-20210108 

PRESS | Cranford Theater Is Newest Addition To Garden State Film Fest 
https://patch.com/new-jersey/cranford/cranford-theatre-take-part-garden-state-film-fest-march 

PRESS | Garden State Festival adds a sixth day and welcomes their newest screening location 
https://www.filmfestivals.com/blog/editor/garden_state_festival_adds_a_sixth_day_and_welcomes_their_newest_screening_location 

PRESS | The The Cranford Theater joins Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.nj.com/suburbannews/2021/01/the-cranford-theater-joins-garden-state-film-festival.html 



PRESS | The Cranford Theater Joins the Garden State Film Festival 
https://www.newjerseystage.com/articles/2021/01/08/the-cranford-theater-joins-the-garden-state-film-festival/ 

PRESS | Asbury Park Named One of 'America's Most Charming' Towns 
https://943thepoint.com/asbury-park-named-one-of-americas-most-charming-towns/ 

PRESS | iStar and Vin Gopal’s Civic Association Announce Asbury Park Micro-Business Grant Recipients 
https://www.ahherald.com/newsbrief/local-news/27901-istar-and-vin-gopal%E2%80%99s-civic-association-announce-asbury-park-
micro-business-grant-recipients 

PRESS | The Stars Come Out for Virtual Fundraiser 
https://www.thesandpaper.net/articles/the-stars-come-out-for-virtual-fundraiser/ 

 


